- - HORIZON DISTRIBUTORS, INC. - -

BID OFFER SHEET
Page 1 of 1

City of Seattle
ITB-PKS-3482
Title: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

FREIGHT: All freight and delivery charges are to be included in the cost of each item.

All equipment considered in this Bid must comply with City of Seattle Parks and Recreations
Standards for irrigation systems. See embedded Standard Specification Excerpt listings
materials specifications. See embedded Standard Details for controller-related items. All
items shown on controller assembly panel or enclosure details must be included, unless
specifically excluded at time of request for a specific job, even if items are not listed as
separate product items in the Specification Excerpt or Bid Offer Form (e.g. terminal strip

enclosures).

X X

32 80 00 Irrigation 32 85 13.13 Maxicom
Systems-B-Contract ¢ Control Panel.pdf Non-Maxi Control ParStrongbox Controller

X X

328513.16 328519.13

PART 1: RainBird Maxicom?2 Products

Description Discount Rate from
Current Manufacturer List
Price
RainBird Maxicom2 products 56%

PART 2: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

Item Description List Manufacturer(s) Discount Rate
# from Current
Manufacturer
List Price
Ductile iron pipe and fittings Harco 35%
High density polyethylene (HDPE) pipe JM Eagle 15%
and fittings
Copper pipe and fittings Edmund A. Gray Company 55%
Brass pipe and fittings Edmund A. Gray Company 55%
PVC pipe and fittings Cresline and Lasco 70%
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850U | Febco 40%
(3/4” to 2”)
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850 Febco 40%
(2-1/2” t0 10”)
Backflow prevention device — Febco 825Y | Febco 40%
(3/4” to 2”)
Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 600 Wilkins 50%
Series, all sizes
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Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 500 Wilkins 50%
Series, all sizes

Irrigation booster pumps (type and model | Munro Systems, Inc. 45%
will vary by need)

Manual valves Turfgro 55%
Quick coupling valves and keys/quills Rain Bird 56%
Automatic control valve assemblies — Buckner, Superior 55%
Buckner/Superior VB/HD Series brass

valve

Automatic control valve — Superior 950 Superior 55%
Series, 950PRS

Master valve — Superior #3100, up to 3” Superior 55%
Master valve — Superior #3200, up to 3” Superior 55%
Master valve - Bermad Ram 400 Series, Bermad 40%
4” and larger

Automatic control valve repair parts, Basic Irrigation 40%
including solenoids, all brands

Wireless flow sensor system: sensor, Rain Bird 56%
transmitter, receiver and antennas

Prefabricated PVC swing joints Lasco 70%
Schedule 40 galvanized steel swing joints | Edmund A. Gray Company 55%
Ductile iron swing joints 20%
Irrigation heads: Toro 640 Series Toro 55%
Irrigation heads: Toro T5, 800 Series, 300 | Toro 55%
Series, 570 Series

Irrigation heads: Hunter I-10, 1-20, I-25, I- Hunter 59%
40, PGP Series

Irrigation heads: RainBird 1800 Series Rain Bird 56%
Irrigation nozzles, compatible with above Rain Bird 56%
heads

Repair parts for above irrigation heads Rain Bird 56%
Pentek or NDS Pro Series valve boxes NDS 76%
with locking lids

RainBird Irrigation ControllerESP-LXME, Rain Bird 56%
ESP-LXMEF

Controller enclosure - Skyline Skyline 15%
Controller enclosure — StrongBox VIT Strongbox 13%
Non-Maxicom controller assembly - parts | Rain Bird 56%
Irrigation control wire — valve wires Regency 60%
Irrigation control wire — PE-89 or PE-39 Regency 60%
shielded communication cable

Wire splice kit 3M-DBY 3M 50%
Grounding rods and connections Regency 60%
Sprinkler head protection collars Orbit 50%

Item Description Unit Price per Unit
#
Pentek Super Jumbo valve box with Pentagon Lock Each $83.81
Fogtite #25-TA concrete vault Each $1355.56
Fogtite #2 meter box or Christy concrete vault with metal Each $256.82

lid

Page 2 of 4




2015-07-09 13:27 Horizon HB40 4252772929 >> 14806196323 P /1
| Qlympic Foundry cast iron roadway box Each $59.19
RainBird 1Q Network Communication Cartridge — $833.80
B GPRS/CDMA f _ e
Cal Amp Vanguard 3000 cell moderm/router, w/ power Each $665.56
supply, antenna and standard cable package _ ' N
Non-Maxicom controller assembly — service to assemble Each $400
Maxicom controiler assembly — service to assemble Each $400

1. ltis MANDATORY that you provide a Discount Rate if bidding on Part 1. It is MANDATORY
that your pravide a Manufacturer, Discount Rate and Price (if applicable) if bidding on Part 2.
You do not need to bid on bath parts, and you do not need to bid on every item if bidding on
Part 2.

2. The bid prices shall include and cover all duties, handling and transportation charges and all
charges incidental to the requested work excluding Sales Tax or Use Tax, Offer ghall agree
to all City contract Terms and Conditions without exception,

3. Do not mark, write-in or add any exceptions to the specifications, schedule, terms or
conditions. Do not attach alternative boilerplate. Any such exceptions can invalidate your
Offer and the Buyer ¢an reject your Bid.

4. If you make an error in typing your prices or any corrections to your Offer Submittal, you may
mark it in ink and initial the correction. if it is not marked in ink and or it is not initialled, the
Buyer may raject your bid, Do not use whiteout.

5. Price Changes in future contract years shall be in accordance with the specifications, Whole
sale and mark-up discount rates will nat change through the life of the contract. Cther price
changes are restricted to the specifications stated in the solicitation and the contract.

6. Prompt Payment Discount: % days. Note: Prompt payment discount
perods equal io or greater than 10 calendar days will receive consideration and bid pricing
will be reduced for evaluation by the armount of that discount.

7. Interlocal Agreement: The City of Seattle has entered into Interlocal Agreements with other
governmental agencies pursuant to RCW 39,34, in lieu of those agencies conducting a
saparate competitive bid. Does Vendor agree to provide this product or service to such
agencies?

Yaes: x Mo.

]

By submitting this Bid, Vendor acknowiedges he/she has read and understands the
entire Invitation to Bid and agrees to comply with Jts terms and conditions. The
Vendor also agrees to fulfill the offer made in their Bid through any subsequently
awarded Contract.

Full Legal Name of Company; __Harizan Distributors, Inc.

Signed By: ﬁﬂ% e
7
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Printed Name: Ryan Farrell

Date: 07/09/2015
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- - JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES - -

BID OFFER SHEET
Page 1 of 1

City of Seattle
ITB-PKS-3482
Title: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

FREIGHT: All freight and delivery charges are to be included in the cost of each item.

All equipment considered in this Bid must comply with City of Seattle Parks and Recreations
Standards for irrigation systems. See embedded Standard Specification Excerpt listings
materials specifications. See embedded Standard Details for controller-related items. All
items shown on controller assembly panel or enclosure details must be included, unless
specifically excluded at time of request for a specific job, even if items are not listed as
separate product items in the Specification Excerpt or Bid Offer Form (e.g. terminal strip

enclosures).

"X "X

32 8000 Irrigation 32 85 13.13 Maxicom

“x "X

328513.16
Systems-B-Contract ¢ Control Panel.pdf Non-Maxi Control ParStrongbox Controlier

PART 1: RainBird Maxicom2 Products

3285 19.13

Description Discount Rate from
Current Manufacturer List
Price
RainBird Maxicom2 producis % No bid

PART 2: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

Item Description List Manufacturer(s) Discount Rate
# from Current
Manufacturer
List Price
Ductile iron pipe and fittings No bid %
High density polyethylene (HDPE) pipe Cresline, Various 60.0%
and fittings
Copper pipe and fittings Various 57.0%
Brass pipe and fittings Matco Norca 75.5%
PVC pipe and fittings Spears, Dura 77.5%
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850U Febco 40.0%
(3/4" to 2
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850 No bid %
(2-1/2" t0 10")
Backflow prevention device —~ Febco 825Y Febco 46.0%

(3/4” to 2")
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Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 600 Wilkins/Zurn 56.5%

Series, all sizes

Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 500 Wilkins/Zurn 52.0%

Series, all sizes

Irrigation booster pumps (type and model No bid %

will vary by need)

Manual valves No bid %

Quick coupling valves and keys/quills Rainbird, Hunter, Buckner 50.0%

Automatic control valve assemblies — No bid %

Buckner/Superior VB/HD Series brass

valve

Automatic control valve — Superior 950 No bid %

Series, 950PRS

Master valve — Superior #3100, up to 3” Superior 50.0%

Master valve — Superior #3200, up to 37 Superior 50.0%

Master valve - Bermad Ram 400 Series, No bid %

4” and larger

Automatic control valve repair parts, No bid %

including solenoids, all brands

Wireless flow sensor system: sensor, No bid %

transmitter, receiver and antennas

Prefabricated PVC swing joints Lasco, Rainbird, Hunter 63.0%

Schedule 40 galvanized steel swing joints No bid Y%

Ductile iron swing joints No bid %

Irrigation heads: Toro 640 Series Toro 50.0%

Irrigation heads: Toro T5, 800 Series, 300 Toro 50.0%

Series, 670 Series

Irrigation heads: Hunter 1-10, 1-20, I-25, |- Hunter 50.0%

40, PGP Series

Irrigation heads: RainBird 1800 Series Rainbird 50.0%

Irrigation nozzles, compatible with above Toro, Rainbird, Hunter 50.0%

heads

Repair parts for above irrigation heads Toro, Rainbird, Hunter 50.0%

Pentek or NDS Pro Series valve boxes NDS 70.0%

with locking lids

RainBird Irrigation ControllerESP-LXME, Rainbird 50.0%

ESP-LXMEF

Controller enclosure - Skyline No bid %

Controller enclosure — StrongBox VIT/Strongbox 21.0%

Non-Maxicom controller assembly - paris _No bid %

irrigation control wire — valve wires Paige, Various 72.5%

frrigation control wire — PE-89 or PE-39 Paige, Various 49.5%

shielded communication cable

Wire splice kit 3M-DBY 3M 49.0%

Grounding rods and connections Various 49.0%

Sprinkler head protection collars No bid %
Item Description Unit Price per Unit

#
Pentek Super Jumbo valve box with Pentagon Lock Each $ No bid
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Fogtite #25-TA concrete vault Each $ No bid
Fogtite #2 meter box or Christy concrete vault with metal Each $ No bid
lid

Olympic Foundry cast iron rcadway box Each $ No bid
RainBird 1Q Network Communication Cartridge — $ No bid
GPRS/CDMA

Cal Amp Vanguard 3000 cell modem/router, w/ power Each $ No bid
supply, antenna and standard cable package

Non-Maxicom controller assembly — service to assemble Each $ No bid
Maxicom controller assembly — service to assemble Each $ No bid

. Itis MANDATORY that you provide a Discount Rate if bidding on Part 1. It is MANDATORY

. that your provide a Manufacturer, Discount Rate and Price (if applicable) if bidding on Part 2.
You do not need to bid on both parts, and you do not need to bid on every item if bidding on
Part 2.

The bid prices shall include and cover all duties, handling and transportation charges and all
charges incidental to the requested work excluding Sales Tax or Use Tax. Offer shall agree
to all City contract Terms and Conditions without exception.

Do not mark, write-in or add any exceptions to the specifications, schedule, terms or
conditions. Do not attach alternative boilerplate. Any such exceptions can invalidate your
Offer and the Buyer can reject your Bid.

If you make an error in typing your prices or any corrections to your Offer Submittal, you may
mark it in ink and initial the correction. If it is not marked in ink and or it is not initialled, the
Buyer may reject your bid. Do not use whitecut.

Price Changes in future contract years shall be in accordance with the specifications. Whole
sale and mark-up discount rates will not change through the life of the contract. Other price
changes are restricted {o the specifications stated in the solicitation and the contract.

Prompt Payment Discount: O %Hﬁodays. Note: Prompt payment discount
periods equal to or greater than 10 calendar days will receive consideration and bid pricing
will be reduced for evaluation by the amount of that discount.

Interlocal Agreement: The City of Seattle has entered into Interlocal Agreements with other
governmental agencies pursuant to RCW 39.34, in lieu of those agencies conducting a
separate competitive bid. Does Vendor agree to provide this product or service to such

agencies?
Yes: \/ No:

By submitting this Bid, Vendor acknowledges he/she has read and understands the
entire Invitation to Bid and agrees to comply with its terms and conditions. The
Vendor also aarees to fulfill the offer made in their Bid through any subseauently
awarded Contract.

John Deere Landscapes
Full Legal Name of Company: _

Signed ;}%ﬂ\% :W' VMM
J
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Printed Name: [{\0 l 7 Q’M( S)ﬂ ptg

Date: j/ U/[Q

L
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- - HD FOWLER COMPANY - -

BID OFFER SHEET
Page 1 of 1

City of Seattle
ITB-PKS-3482
Title: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

FREIGHT: All freight and delivery charges are to be included in the cost of each item.

All equipment considered in this Bid must comply with City of Seattle Parks and Recreations
Standards for irrigation systems. See embedded Standard Specification Excerpt listings
materials specifications. See embedded Standard Details for controller-related items. All
items shown on controller assembly panel or enclosure details must be included, unless
specifically excluded at time of request for a specific job, even if items are not listed as
separate product items in the Specification Excerpt or Bid Offer Form (e.g. terminal strip

enclosures).

X X

32 80 00 Irrigation 32 85 13.13 Maxicom
Systems-B-Contract ¢ Control Panel.pdf Non-Maxi Control ParStrongbox Controller

X X

328513.16 328519.13

PART 1: RainBird Maxicom?2 Products

Description Discount Rate from
Current Manufacturer List
Price
RainBird Maxicom2 products 52 %

PART 2: Irrigation Equipment and Supplies

Item Description List Manufacturer(s) Discount Rate
# from Current
Manufacturer
List Price
Ductile iron pipe and fittings U S Pipe (pipe) 30 %
High density polyethylene (HDPE) pipe Hi Country Fusion 34 %
and fittings
Copper pipe and fittings Great Lakes Copper (pipe) 58 %
Brass pipe and fittings Merit Brass (pipe) 38 %
PVC pipe and fittings JM Eagle (pipe) 28 %
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850U Febco 36 %
(3/4" to 27)
Backflow prevention device — Febco 850 Febco 36 %
(2-1/2” t0 10”)
Backflow prevention device — Febco 825Y Febco 36 %
(3/4” to 27)
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Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 600 Wilkins 35 %

Series, all sizes

Pressure reducing valve — Wilkins 500 Wilkins 35 %

Series, all sizes

Irrigation booster pumps (type and model Watertronics 20 %

will vary by need)

Manual valves Harco 35 %

Quick coupling valves and keys/quills Buckner 44 %

Automatic control valve assemblies — Buckner 44 %

Buckner/Superior VB/HD Series brass

valve

Automatic control valve — Superior 950 Superior 50 %

Series, 950PRS

Master valve — Superior #3100, up to 3” Superior 50 %

Master valve — Superior #3200, up to 3” Superior 50 %

Master valve - Bermad Ram 400 Series, Bermad 30 %

4” and larger

Automatic control valve repair parts, 40 %

including solenoids, all brands

Wireless flow sensor system: sensor, %

transmitter, receiver and antennas

Prefabricated PVC swing joints Lasco 45 %

Schedule 40 galvanized steel swing joints Anvil 85 %

Ductile iron swing joints Harco 35 %

Irrigation heads: Toro 640 Series Toro 52 %

Irrigation heads: Toro T5, 800 Series, 300 Toro 54 %

Series, 570 Series

Irrigation heads: Hunter I-10, 1-20, I-25, I- Hunter 60 %

40, PGP Series

Irrigation heads: RainBird 1800 Series Rainbird 55 %

Irrigation nozzles, compatible with above Rainbird 55 %

heads

Repair parts for above irrigation heads Rainbird 40 %

Pentek or NDS Pro Series valve boxes NDS 50 %

with locking lids

RainBird Irrigation ControllerESP-LXME, Rainbird 55 %

ESP-LXMEF

Controller enclosure - Skyline %

Controller enclosure — StrongBox Strongbox 15 %

Non-Maxicom controller assembly - parts %

Irrigation control wire — valve wires Regency 38 %

Irrigation control wire — PE-89 or PE-39 Regency 38 %

shielded communication cable

Wire splice kit 3M-DBY 3M Co. 30 %

Grounding rods and connections 3M Co. 30 %

Sprinkler head protection collars %
Item Description Unit Price per Unit

#
Pentek Super Jumbo valve box with Pentagon Lock Each $142.73
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Fogtite #25-TA concrete vault Each $1,410.00
:i:c(j)gtite #2 meter box or Christy concrete vault with metal Each $ 146.50
Olympic Foundry cast iron roadway box Each $63.43
RainBird 1Q Network Communication Cartridge — #IQONCCGP $991.32
GPRS/CDMA ==l
Cal Amp Vanguard 3000 cell modem/router, w/ power Each

$ 750.00
supply, antenna and standard cable package
Non-Maxicom controller assembly — service to assemble Each $ 780.00
Maxicom controller assembly — service to assemble Each $ 780.00

Itis MANDATORY that you provide a Discount Rate if bidding on Part 1. It is MANDATORY
that your provide a Manufacturer, Discount Rate and Price (if applicable) if bidding on Part 2.
You do not need to bid on both parts, and you do not need to bid on every item if bidding on
Part 2.

The bid prices shall include and cover all duties, handling and transportation charges and all
charges incidental to the requested work excluding Sales Tax or Use Tax. Offer shall agree
to all City contract Terms and Conditions without exception.

Do not mark, write-in or add any exceptions to the specifications, schedule, terms or
conditions. Do not attach alternative boilerplate. Any such exceptions can invalidate your
Offer and the Buyer can reject your Bid.

If you make an error in typing your prices or any corrections to your Offer Submittal, you may
mark it in ink and initial the correction. If it is not marked in ink and or it is not initialled, the
Buyer may reject your bid. Do not use whiteout.

Price Changes in future contract years shall be in accordance with the specifications. Whole
sale and mark-up discount rates will not change through the life of the contract. Other price
changes are restricted to the specifications stated in the solicitation and the contract.

Prompt Payment Discount: n/a % days. Note: Prompt payment discount
periods equal to or greater than 10 calendar days will receive consideration and bid pricing
will be reduced for evaluation by the amount of that discount.

Interlocal Agreement: The City of Seattle has entered into Interlocal Agreements with other
governmental agencies pursuant to RCW 39.34, in lieu of those agencies conducting a
separate competitive bid. Does Vendor agree to provide this product or service to such
agencies?

Yes: X No:

By submitting this Bid, Vendor acknowledges he/she has read and understands the
entire Invitation to Bid and agrees to comply with its terms and conditions. The
Vendor also agrees to fulfill the offer made in their Bid through any subsequently
awarded Contract.

Full Legal Name of Company: _H D Fowler
Co.

Signed By:

Page 3 of 4



| Printed Name: __ Richard Simpson

| Date: July 8, 2015
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